
Part  IV—Section  1

Tamil  Nadu  Bills

CONTENTS

No. 319] CHENNAI, SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER 10, 2011
Aavani  24, Thiruvalluvar Aandu–2042

TAMIL  NADU
GOVERNMENT GAZETTE
EXTRAORDINARY PUBLISHED  BY  AUTHORITY

© [Regd. No. TN/CCN/467/2009-11.
GOVERNMENT  OF   TAMIL  NADU [R. Dis. No. 197/2009.

2011 [Price:  Rs. 2.40  Paise.

[ 95 ]DTP  IV-1 Ex. (319)—1

BILLS :

No. 19 of 2011—Tamil Nadu Value Added Tax (Amendment) Act, 2011..

No. 20 of 2011—Tamil Nadu Societies Registration (Amendment)
Act, 2011       .. .. .. .. .. ..

95-97

99-100

Pages.



96 TAMIL  NADU  GOVERNMENT  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY

A Bill further to amend the Tamil Nadu Value Added Tax Act, 2006.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in the
Sixty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Value Added Tax (Amendment)
Act, 2011.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 26th day of
August 2010.

2. In section 2 of the Tamil Nadu Value Added Tax Act, 2006 (hereinafter
referred to as the principal Act),—

(i) clause (6) shall be omitted;

(ii) after clause (16), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:—

“(16-A) “Deputy Commercial Tax Officer” means any person appointed
by the Commissioner by name or by virtue of his office, to exercise the powers
of a Deputy Commercial Tax Officer.”.

3.  In section 49 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), for the expression
“an Assistant Commercial Tax Officer”, the expression “Deputy Commercial
Tax Officer” shall be substituted.

4. In section 64 of the principal Act, in sub-section (4), for the expression
“Assistant Commercial Tax Officer”, the expression “Deputy Commercial Tax
Officer” shall be substituted.

5. In section 81 of the principal Act,—

(i) in sub-section (1), for the expression “an Assistant Commercial Tax
Officer”, the expression “Deputy Commercial Tax Officer” shall be substituted;

(ii) in sub-section (3), for the expression “an Assistant Commercial Tax
Officer”, the expression “Deputy Commercial Tax Officer” shall be substituted.

6. In section 82 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the expression
“an Assistant Commercial Tax Officer”, the expression “Deputy Commercial
Tax Officer” shall be substituted.

Short title and
commence-
ment.

Tamil Nadu
Act
32 of 2006.

Amendment of
section 2.

BILLS INTRODUCED IN THE LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE
STATE OF TAMIL NADU

Under Rule 130 of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly Rules, the following Bill which was
introduced in the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu on 10th September, 2011
is published together with Statement of Objects and Reasons for general information:—

L.A. Bill No. 19 of 2011

Amendment of
section 49.

Amendment of
section 64.

Amendment of
section 81.

Amendment of
section 82.



TAMIL  NADU  GOVERNMENT  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY 97

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS.

In G.O.Ms.No. 265, Finance (Pay cell) Department, dated 26-08-2010,
orders were issued re-designating the post of “Assistant Commercial Tax
Officer” as “Deputy Commercial Tax Officer”. In view of the above
re-designation of the authority, the references to the said authority in the
Tamil Nadu Value Added Tax Act, 2006 (Tamil Nadu Act 32 of 2006) have
to be suitably substituted. Accordingly, the Government have decided to amend
the said Act for the purpose.

2. The Bill seeks to achieve the above object.

Agri S.S. KRISHNAMOORTHY,
Minister for Commercial Taxes

and Registration.

A.M.P. JAMALUDEEN,
Secretary.



98 TAMIL  NADU  GOVERNMENT  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY



TAMIL  NADU  GOVERNMENT  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY 99

Under Rule 130 of the Tamil Nadu Legislative Assembly Rules, the following Bill which was
introduced in the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu on 10th September,
2011 is published together with Statement of Objects and Reasons for general information:—

L.A. Bill No. 20 of 2011

A Bill further to amend the Tamil Nadu Soceties Registration
Act, 1975.

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Tamil Nadu in the
Sixty-second Year of the Republic of India as follows:—

1. (1) This Act may be called the Tamil Nadu Sociecties Registration
(Amendment) Act, 2011.

(2) It shall come into force on such date as the State Government may,
by notification, appoint.

2. In the Schedule to the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration Act, 1975,—

(a) in item 1, for the words “Five hundred Rupees”, the words
“Two thousand Rupees” shall be substituted;

(b) in item 2, for the words “Ten Rupees”, the words “One hundred
Rupees” shall be substituted;

(c) in item 3, for the words “Twenty-five Rupees”, the words
“Two hundred and fifty Rupees” shall be substituted;

(d) in item 4, for the words “Twenty-five Rupees”, the words
“Two hundred and fifty Rupees” shall be substituted;

(e) in item 5, for the words “Five Rupees for every hundred words or
fractional part thereof required to be copied”, the words “Ten Rupees per
page” shall be substituted;

(f) in item 6, for the words “Ten Rupees”, the words “One hundred
Rupees” shall be substituted;

(g) in item 7, for the words “One hundred Rupees”, the words
“One thousand Rupees” shall be substituted;

Amendment of
Schedule.

Tamil Nadu Act
27 of 1975.

Short title and
commence-
ment.



100 TAMIL  NADU  GOVERNMENT  GAZETTE  EXTRAORDINARY

STATEMENT OF OBJECTS AND REASONS.

The Table of fees to be paid to the Registrar under the Tamil Nadu Societies
Registration Act, 1975 was earlier revised in June 2002. In as much as more
than nine years have lapsed since the fees were lastly revised, to make the
fees commensurate with the cost of the services rendered by the Registration
Department, the Government have decided to revise the fee payable to the
Registrar and to amend the Schedule to the Tamil Nadu Societies Registration
Act, 1975 (Tamil Nadu Act 27 of 1975) for the purpose.

2. The Bill seeks to give effect to the above decision.

Agri S.S. KRISHNAMOORTHY,
Minister for Commercial Taxes

and Registration.

A.M.P. JAMALUDEEN,
Secretary.

PRINTED AND PUBLISHED BY THE DIRECTOR OF STATIONERY AND PRINTING, CHENNAI
ON BEHALF OF THE GOVERNMENT OF TAMIL NADU


